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Black pepper, christened as “King of spices” and “Black gold” is the most 
important and the most widely used spice in the world occupying a posi�on 
that is supreme and unique. Black pepper is valued for its characteris�c 
pungency and flavor and hence used extensively as a spice and a condiment 
in vast variety of food prepara�ons. It is an important ingredient in 
tradi�onal medicine too. Black pepper is predominantly a self-pollinated 
perennial, blessed with viable seed produc�on as well as vegeta�ve 
propaga�on. This dual advantage offers a great scope for breeders to 
exploit vigour as well as selec�on breeding. The main breeding objec�ves 
envisaged in black pepper are higher yield, improvement in quality (high 
bulk density, dry recovery, higher levels of essen�al oil, piperine and 
oleoresin), resistance to foot rot disease caused by Phytophthora capsici, 
resistance to nematodes, (Radopholus similis and Meloidogyne incognita), 
resistance to insect pests especially the pollu beetle (Longitarsus 
nigripennis), resistance to drought, shade tolerance, response to low inputs 
(organic breeding), suitable for high al�tude and mixed cropping. 

In India, more than 100 pepper cul�vars are found with good inter and intra 
cul�var variability. Evalua�on and screening of black pepper germplasm for 
various agronomic traits, resistance to bio�c and abio�c stresses, yield and 
quality a�ribu�ng characters have resulted in iden�fying sources of 
important genes for these characters. The breeding programmes 
a�empted in black pepper are selec�on from within germplasm (inter-
cul�var selec�on or germplasm selec�on), within a cul�var (intra cul�var 
selec�on or clonal selec�on), selec�on in segrega�ng open pollinated or 
selfed progenies and hybridiza�on. Eighteen improved varie�es of black 
pepper have been released by various research organiza�ons for 
cul�va�on. Panniyur-1, Panniyur-3 and Panniyur-8 are the hybrids evolved 
at the Pepper Research Sta�on, Panniyur (Kerala Agricultural University). 
IISR Girimunda and IISR Malabar Excel are the two hybrids released from 
ICAR-Indian Ins�tute of Spices Research, Kozhikode, Kerala.

The ability to iden�fy varie�es of black pepper is important for researchers 
and farmers. Selec�on of loca�on specific varie�es is one of the parameters 
for successful cul�va�on. Furthermore, introduc�on of Protec�on of Plant 
Varie�es and Farmers Rights Act, 2001 has also necessitated reliable 
iden�fica�on methods. This book provides informa�on on iden�fica�on of 
black pepper varie�es based on shoot �p colour, leaf characteris�cs, spike 
characteris�cs etc., so that iden�ty can be checked during selec�on and 
growing of black pepper varie�es. True varietal iden�ty is very important in 
produc�on and mul�plica�on of quality nucleus plan�ng material of 
varie�es. Photographs in this book provide excellent keys to the possible 
iden�fica�on of released varie�es of black pepper.
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Panniyur 1
Panniyur 2
Panniyur 3
Panniyur 4
Panniyur 5
Panniyur 6
Panniyur 7
Panniyur 8
Panniyur 9

Sreekara

Subhakara
Panchami
Pournami
IISR Thevam
IISR Malabar Excel
IISR Girimunda
IISR Shakthi
PLD- 2
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